
135-20
BID DATE: June 16th, 2020

EMERGENCY GENERATORS INSTALLATION

1. Mike Spagnuolo Electrical Contractor Base Bid:       $82,990.00
Mike Spagnuolo Alternate Bid 1:    $123,850.00
69 Oakridge Road Alternate Bid 2:    $116,830.00
West Orange, NJ  07052 Alternate Bid 2A:  $103,980.00
973-325-6812 - Tel
206-378-2709
msec@mikeywirs.com

2. Astro Electrical Contractor, LLC Base Bid:       $58,000.00
Walter H. Paz Alternate Bid 1:       $74,000.00
1415 E. Elizabeth Ave. Alternate Bid 2:      $138,000.00
Linden, NJ  07036 Alternate Bid 2A:   $127,000.00
908-925-2113 - Tel
908-925-2115 – Fax
dpastro20@gmail.com

3. Multi-Phase Electrical Services, Inc. Base Bid:        $92,050.00
Matthew Deli Alternate Bid 1:      $118,700.00
15 William Street Alternate Bid 2:      $166,800.00
Closter, NJ  07624 Alternate Bid 2A:   $159,050.00
201-207-7870 – Tel
201- 297-7866 - Fax
mdell@mpesinc.com

4. A C I Electrical Contractor Inc. NO BID
Anthony Infantolino
548 Oldwoods Road
Wyckoff, NJ  07481
201-522-6026 – Tel
Does not have a fax number
Anthony@ACIelectrical.com

5. Advanced Control Systems Base Bid:      $51,153.25
John Baldassarre Alternate Bid 1:      $51,153.25
12 Champions Way Alternate Bid 2:    $119,306.50
Manalapan, NJ   07726 Alternate Bid 2A: $102,306.50
732-234-3232 – Tel
Has no fax number
johnb@ACScompany.net
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6. Dodge Data & Analytics NO BID
Kate Vozza
4300 Beltway Pl, Ste. 150
Arlington, TX  76018
609-336-2636 - Tel
609-336-5911 – Fax
dodge.docs@construction.com

7. Manor II Electric, INC Base Bid:                  $80,000.00
Alex Haile Alternate Bid 1:      $84,000.00
3 Ardsley Court Alternate Bid 2:    $132,000.00
Holmdel, N.J. 07733 Alternate Bid 2A:  $122,000.00
973-465-5040 – Tel
973-465-5570 – Fax
manorII@optimum.net

8. Vanore Electric Inc. NO BID
John or Brian
238 High Street
Hackensack, NJ 07601
973-897-1172 – Tel
201-342-1452 – Fax
Brian@vanore-electric.com

9. Matt Jackowitz NO BID
500 West Main Street, suite #4
Wyckoff, NJ 07481
201-485-7353 – Tel
775-576-9657 – Fax
Matt.Jackowitz@EastAlliance.com

10. CFM Construction, INC NO BID
Carmine Coscia
5 Bay Street
Stirling, NJ 07980
908-903-9477 – Tel
908-903-9478 – Fax
carminecoscia@cfmconstruction.com

11. D & M Electrical LLC Base Bid:               $40,000.00
Zoranco Bozinov Alternate Bid 1:   $33,000.00
3 Borrego Drive Alternate Bid 2:   $92,630.00
Woodland Park, N.J. 07424 Alternate Bid 2A: $82,000.00
862-262-8487 – Tel
973-435-7498 – Fax
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admin@dmelectricalllc.com

12. Power With Prestige Inc. Base Bid:    $62,000.00
Joseph P. Carroll II Alternate Bid 1:    $70,000.00
40 Swartswood Road Alternate Bid 2:    $117,000.00
Newton, NJ  07860 Alternate Bid 2A: $107,000.00
973 978-4018 - Tel
973-940-1994 – Fax
joe@pwpinc.biz
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