

**FIRE STATION #1 INTERIOR & EXTERIOR IMPROVEMENTS & RENOVATIONS &  
WINDOW REPLACEMENT SUMMARY OF BIDS**

- |    |   |                    |              |
|----|---|--------------------|--------------|
| 1. | Frankoski Construction<br>314 Dodd St.<br>East Orange, NJ 07017                                 | NO BID             |              |
| 2. | Northeast Roof Maintenance, Inc.<br>649 Catherine Street<br>Perth Amboy, NJ 08861               | NO BID             |              |
| 3. | AB Contracting, LLC.<br>10 Theodore St.<br>Wharton, NJ 07885                                    | NO BID             |              |
| 4. | JR. Contracting & Environmental<br>1141 Route 23 South<br>Wayne, NJ 07470                       | BASE BID:          | \$889,000.00 |
|    |   | ADD ALT BID NO. 1: | \$110,000.00 |
|    |   | ADD ALT BID NO. 2: | \$30,000.00  |
| 5. | Wallkill Group<br>3505 Route 94<br>Hamburg, NJ 07419  | BASE BID:          | \$875,000.00 |
|    |   | ADD ALT BID NO. 1: | \$138,000.00 |
|    |   | ADD ALT BID NO. 2: | \$60,000.00  |
| 6. | McGinley Building Services<br>18 Main Road<br>Montville, NJ 07045                               | NO BID             |              |
| 7. | George Koustas Painting & Construction LLC<br>70 Beechwood Avenue<br>West Long Branch, NJ 07764 | BASE BID:          | \$974,000.00 |
|    |   | ADD ALT BID NO. 1: | \$95,000.00  |
|    |   | ADD ALT BID NO. 2: | \$20,000.00  |
| 8. | Panoramic Window & Door Systems, Inc.<br>712 Sergeantsville Road<br>Stockton, NJ 08559          | NO BID             |              |

- |  |  |
|--|--|
| 9. Reliable NYC LLC<br>1286 Waterloo Road<br>Stanhope, NJ 07874                                | BASE BID: \$189,000.00<br>ADD ALT BID NO. 1: \$112,000.00<br>ADD ALT BID NO. 2: \$897,000.00   |
| 10. A1 Construction Service, Inc.<br>2468 N. Jerusalem Rd. Ste.1<br>North Bellmore, NY 11710   | BASE BID: \$3,420,000.00<br>ADD ALT BID NO. 1: \$249,000.00<br>ADD ALT BID NO. 2: \$162,000.00 |
| 11. Dodge Data & Analytics<br>2860 S. State Hwy 161, Ste 160 #501<br>Grand Prairie, TX 75052   | NO BID   |
| 12. FCI Group<br>Falak Construction, Inc.<br>836 Ridgewood Avenue<br>North Brunswick, NJ 08902 | BASE BID: \$819,000.00<br>ADD ALT BID NO. 1: \$30,000.00<br>ADD ALT BID NO. 2: \$819,000.00    |
| 13. ZN Construction, LLC<br>185 East 54 <sup>th</sup> Street<br>Elmwood Park, NJ 07407         | NO BID   |